
Hastings Area School System 2023 Bond Projects - 

BP#3 - High School Roofing
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 BASE BID  BOND  BASE & BOND TOTAL 
 APPARENT               

LOW BID 

ALTERNATE #1 - 

EPDM 

ALTERNATE #3 - 

ROOF HATCHES

075000 - Roofing

075000 - Roofing 1,716,907.00$                 

Beyer Roofing x x x x x 1,704,782.00$             12,125.00$        1,716,907.00$              NO BID 25,000.00$           

Weathershield Roofing x x x x x 2,324,611.00$             22,631.00$        2,347,242.00$              78,582.00$         12,584.00$           

Great Lakes Roofing & Insulation x x x x x 2,620,000.00$             29,000.00$        2,649,000.00$              NO BID 15,000.00$           

Superior Services x x x x x 3,158,000.00$             20,810.00$        3,178,810.00$              NO BID 48,100.00$           

D7BCI x x x x x 3,272,400.00$             14,545.00$        3,286,945.00$              66,594.00$         58,450.00$           

Great Lakes Systems x x x x x 3,291,000.00$             12,640.00$        3,303,640.00$              89,530.00$         53,980.00$           

Hoekstra Roofing x x x x x 4,473,000.00$             25,300.00$        4,498,300.00$              (72,600.00)$        14,800.00$           

Vesatile Roofing Systems x x x x x 4,901,025.00$             26,235.00$        4,927,260.00$              67,850.00$         23,996.00$           

999,999,999.00$           

TOTAL - APPARENT LOW BIDS 1,716,907.00$             NO BID 25,000.00$           


